Council Chamber, February 25, 2015

President Gerken convened the public meeting of Hanover Borough Council in the
Hanover Municipal Building, 44 Frederick Street, Hanover, Pennsylvania at 6:00 PM as

advertised.

The meeting started with the Pledge of Allegiance followed by a moment of silent

prayer.

Roll Call:

The following municipalities were present this evening:

Conewago Township — Supervisors Ernst, Legore and Knight were
present. This represented a quorum.

Hanover Borough — Council Members present were Eline, Funke, Gerken,
McLin, Marcoccio, Morris, Roth and Yingling; Mayor Adams; Solicitor
Yingst; Manager Krebs and Secretary Miller. Mrs. Griffin and Mr. Reichart
were absent. The Secretary announced a quorum.

Germany Township — Supervisors Osborne and Smith were present. This
represented a quorum.

McSherrystown Borough — Council Members Bolton, Duvall, Forbes,
McKim and Smith were present; and Manager Cook. This represented a
quorum, ¥

Penn Township — Commissioners present were Felix, Heilman and Klunk;
and Assistant Manager Rodgers. This represented a quorum.

Union Township — Supervisors Aldridge and Freet were present which
represented a quorum.

West Manheim Township — Supervisors present were Blettner, Hartlaub,
and Staaf. This represented a quorum.

CITIZENS WITH ITEMS OF BUSINESS TO BE BROUGHT BEFORE THE

MUNICIPALITIES

None was presented for any of the municipalities in attendance.

REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Bituminous Paving Materials

Hanover Borough — It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to accept the

bid and award the contract to York Materials Group LLC for premixed bituminous
concrete under Alternate #1 and Alternate #2 to Bituminous Paving Materials of
York, Inc. for the following bid prices as quoted:

REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Bituminous Paving Materials

FOB Plant — Alternate #1

1. ID2 Surface Course (SRL Type M) $59.95 per ton.
2. ID2 Base Course $50.20 per ton.
3. Pre-mixed Bituminous Stock Pile Material __$90.00 per ton.
4, Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) $48.75 per ton.
5.

ID3 Surface Course $53.40 per ton.



REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Bituminous Paving Materials

FOB Plant — Alternate #1

6. 9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course $59.95 per ton.
7. 19 mm Superpave Surface Course $53.70 per ton.
8. 25 mm Superpave Base Course $50.20 per ton.

FOB Job — Alternate #2

1. ID2 (SRL Type M Aggregate) $ $63.95 per ton.
2. ID2 (SRL - Type H & M Aggregate) $ $63.95 per ton.
3. ID2 Base Course $ $54.20 per ton.
4, Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) $52.75 per ton.
5. ID3 Surface Course $ $57.40 per ton.
6. 9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course $ $63.95 per ton.
7. 19 mm Superpave Surface Course $ $57.70 per ton.
8. 25 mm Superpave Base Course $ $54.20 per ton.

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and
that the proper officers be, and they hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for
the same. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Crushed Stone

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris that Council
accept the bid and award the contract for crushed stone to Vulcan Construction
Materials LP for: '

1. Screenings (AASHTO 10) at a price of $9.75 per ton.
2. PA 2A Stone at a price of $ 6.50 per ton.
3. Sand and Crushed Stone Anti-skid Type 2 at a price of $ 10.70 per ton.

4. 1B Stone (AASHTO #8) & HE6 Stone (AASHTO #9) at a price of $_11.45 per
ton.



REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Crushed Stone

5. 2B Stone (AASHTO #57) at a price of $_10.35 per ton.

6. All other stone including 4-inch Ballast (AASHTO #1) — (AASHTO #3), at a price
of $___10.40 per ton.
7. Rip-Rap at a price of $__14.00 per ton.

All FOB Plant and all in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the
necessary bond and that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to
execute a contract for the same. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Stone Delivery Prices

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris that Council
accept the price per ton for delivery only in full truck load quantities to job locations
as specified at time of delivery in:

a.  HANOVER BOROUGH: $2.25
b.  PENN TOWNSHIP: $2.30
c.  CONEWAGO TOWNSHIP: $1.60
d.  MCSHERRYSTOWN BOROUGH: $1.60
e.  UNION TOWNSHIP: $2.50
f.  WEST MANHEIM TOWNSHIP: $2.50
g.  GERMANY TOWNSHIP $3.30

Motion carried.



REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Crushed Stone

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Petroleum Products

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to accept the
bid award for petroleum products to the following at the bid prices as quoted:

1A. To___Shipley Energy for regular lead-free minimum 87 octane
gasoline for a price of $___1.6362 per gallon.

1B. To __ Shipley Energy for premium or super, minimum 92
octane gasoline for a price of $ __1.7390 per gallon.

2A. To__ PPC Lubricants = for #5-20 motor oil in 55-gallon drums

for a price of $ 6.59 per gallon.

2B. To __ Petrocon Corporation for #15-40 motor oil in bulk for a
price of $ 6.94 per gallon.

2C. To Petrocon Corporation for #15-40 motor oil in 55-gallon
drums for a price of $ 7.79 per gallon.

2D. To ___ Petrocon Corporation for #10-20 hydraulic oil/low

foaming action in bulk for a priceof $ _ 6.31  per gallon.

2E. To__ PPC Lubricants for #10-20 hydraulic oil/low foaming
action in 55-gallon drums for a price of § 7.23 per gallon.

3. To ___PPC Lubricants for multi-purpose grease for a price of $
1.81 per pound.

4. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions dba/Aero Energy
for diesel oil #2 fora priceof §  1.8814  per gallon.

5. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions dba/Aero Energy
for fuel oil #2 for a price of $ 1.9073 per gallon.




REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Petroleum Products

6. No bids on standard kerosene.

7. To PPC Lubricants for transmission fluid-Dexron Il in
55-gallon drums fora priceof § 7.46  per gallon.

8A. To PPC Lubricants for Mobil SCH 634 Synthetic Lubricant, or
equal, in 55 gal drums for a price of § 26.65 per gallon.

All in accordance with specifications and that the proper officers be, and hereby are,
authorized to execute a contract for the same. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. "Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Snow & Ice Rock Salt

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to award the
bid for snow and ice rock salt and calcium chloride at the following quoted bid prices:

Alternate #1 — To Oceanport LLC for bulk snow and ice rock salt for a price

of: $§ 71.15 per ton.

Alternate #2 ~ To_Chemung vSuppl\‘/ Cdrporation for Calcium Chloride in 50 to 100
pound bags or drums for a price of § 660.00 per ton FOB
Borough’s and/or Township’s Public Works buildings.

— To Recon Construction Services for Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32%
Mixture at a price of $1.13 _per gallon FOB Borough’s and/or
Township’s Public Works Buildings.

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and
that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the
same. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.




REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Snow and Ice Rock Salt

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough on Alternate #1 Rock Salt only and award the

contract as per bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion
carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough on Alternate #1 Rock Salt only and award the
contract as per bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion
carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough on Alternate #1 Rock Salt and Alternate #2 Standard
Calcium Chloride and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover Borough at
the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Chemical Products

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to award
chemical products as quoted under Alternate #1 as follows:

1. To__ UNIVAR USA, Inc. for 150 Ib. cylinders of liquid
chlorine at a price of $ 0.77 perlb.
2. To __UNIVAR USA Inc. for one-ton containers of

liquid chlorine at a price of $ 0.38 perlb.

3. To Main Pool & Chemical Co., Inc __or HTH tablets in 100 Ib.
drums at a price of $ 340.00 per 100 Ib. (CWT).

4, To ___Thatcher Company of New York, Inc. __for ferrous sulphate
liquid in full tanker loads at a price of $§ __0.575 per gallon.

5. To ___UNIVAR USA, Inc. for soda ash in 50 Ib. bags at a price of

3 28.50 per 100 Ib. (CWT).

6. To Main Pool & Chemical Co., Inc. for copper
sulphate in 50 Ib. bags at a price of §  250.00 per 100 lb.
(CWT).

7. To ___Main Pool & Chemical Co., Inc. for hydrofluosilicic

acid in 150 Ib. drums only at a price of $ 45.45 per 100 Ib. (CWT).

8. To __Main Pool & Chemical Co., Inc. for hydrofluosilicic acid
in bulk at a price of $ 38.50 per 100 Ib. (CWT).

9. To __ Thatcher Company of New York, Inc. __for liquid alum in full
tanker loads at a price of $ 0.8790 per gallon.
10. To__ UNIVAR USA, Inc. for sulphur dioxide

in one-ton containers at a price of $ 1.370.00 per ton.




REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Chemical Products

11. To___Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. for
liquid polyaluminum chloride in bulk at a price of $ 1.231 per
gallon.

12.  To___UNIVAR USA, Inc. for Liquid Methanol in bulk

at a price of $ 1.40 per gallon.

13. To George S. Coyne Chemical Company, Inc. for sodium
Permanganate in 550 Ib. drums at a price of $ 1.0258 perlb.

14. To _UNIVAR USA, Inc. for caustic soda in bulk at a price of
$_1.59 pergallon.

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and
that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the
same. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid price quoted on number eleven (11) only. Motion carried.

Traffic Line Painting

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to award the
bid for traffic line painting to the following at the following bid prices:

1. To D.E. Gemmiill, Inc. for Center Line Painting: Two (2) four-inch yellow lines at
a price of $0.098 per lineal foot.

2. To D.E. Gemmiill, Inc. for Edge Line Painting: One (1) four-inch white line (solid
or dashed) at a price of $0.048 per lineal foot.

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and

that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the
same. Motion carried.

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough on and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Water Borne Traffic Paint

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to award the
bid for water borne traffic paint to the following at the following bid prices:




REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES

Water Borne Traffic Paint

1. To Sherwin Williams Company, Hanover, Pennsylvania for white paint in 5 gallon
pails at a price of $13.49 per gallon.

2. To Sherwin Wiliams Company, Hanover, Pennsylvania for yellow paint in 5
gallon pails at a price of $14.49 per gallon.

3. To Sherwin Williams Company, Hanover, Pennsylvania for blue paint in 5 gallon
pails at a price of $13.49 per gallon.

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and
that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the
same. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to accept
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to accept the
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried.

Motion to Adjourn the Joint Bid Award Meeting:

Hanover Borough: President Gerken asked if there were any questions regarding
the bids. There being no questions, it was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr.
Morris to adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM. Motion carried.

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Knight, seconded by Ms. Ernst to
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM.

Germany Township: [t was moved by Mr. Osborne, seconded by Mr. Smith to
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM.

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM. Motion carried.

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Heilman to adjourn
the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM. Motion carried.

Union Township: It was moved by Mr. Aldridge, seconded by Mr. Freet to adjourn
the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM. Motion carried.

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. Staaf to
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:17 PM. Motion carried.

Hanover Borough Council President Gerken thanked the municipalities for their
attendance this evening and announced there would be a brief intermission before
continuing with regular Council business for The Borough of Hanover.

INTERMISSION




RETURN TO HANOVER BOROUGH COUNCIL BUSINESS

The meeting resumed at 7:00 PM.

PRELIMINARY MATTERS & OFFICERS’ REPORTS

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Morris to approve the minutes of the
following Council Meetings:

(a) January 28, 2015
(b) February 4, 2015

Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Morris, seconded by Mr. Funke to approve the payment of the bills,
the Report of the Mayor and the Report of the Fire Chief. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Morris, seconded by Mr. Funke to approve the Reports of the
following Borough Administrators:

Borough Manager

Supervisor of Public Works

Superintendent of Water & Wastewater Treatment
Supervisor of Water Treatment Plant

Supervisor of Water Distribution

) Supervisor of Water Meter Department

J) Engineering Department

.)  Library Director

s i (@]

Motion carried.

CITIZENS WITH BUSINESS TO BE BROUGHT BEFORE COUNCIL

None was presented.

Bid Opening: There were two (2) bids received, opened and recorded for the Transfer
Station Hauling contract. (See bid tabulation sheet attached.)

Oath of Office — Mayor Adams administered the Oath of Office to Probationary
Firefighter Jay Lalley, Hanover, PA effective March 14, 2015. Council congratulated Mr.
Lalley on his new position.

Boy Scouts — Troop #105: President Gerken welcomed Boy Scout Troop 105 and
Scout leader Juan Rodriguez to this evening’s Council meeting to earn their Citizens in
the Community Badges.

REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

Finance & Personnel Committee — Mr. Roﬁh

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Eline to ratify the action of the Borough
Officers in making the following investments with ACNB for a period of 28 days, January
30, 2015 to February 27, 2015 at an interest rate of .31%:

Funds Investments

General Fund $1,832,518.25

Bicentennial Fund $1,381.75



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

Finance & Personnel Committee — Mr. Roth

Funds Investments

Sewer Fund $1,270,400.00
Guthrie Memorial Library Fund $74,400.00
Regional Wastewater Treatment Fund $0.00
Market House Fund $38,300.00
Liquid Fuels Fund $0.00
Equipment Fund $588,000.00
Local Services Tax Fund $143,600.00
Business Privilege Tax Fund $46,000.00
Brier Memorial Fund (Library) $11,500.00
Leisure Services Fund $45,400.00
Old Hanover Videos Fund $980.00
Sewer Projects Fund $0.00
Library Projects Fund $35,400.00
Hanover Recreation Endowment Fund $294,500.00

Water Revenue Fund

$1,500,000.00

Water Projects Fund $186,500.00
Market House Reserve Fund $5,663.69
Hanover Recreation Reserve Fund $12,690.83
Library Endowment Fund $865,876.06
Library Endowment Additional Interest ($5,000.00)
2010 Water Bonds $150,000.00
2013 Water Bonds $5,700,000.00
2013 Sewer Bonds $100,000.00
2013 General Bonds $150,000.00
Total . $13.,048,110.58

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to acknowledge and accept the
Compliance Audit for the Firemen's Relief Association of the Borough of Hanover, York
County, Pennsylvania for the Period of January 1, 2011 to December 31, 2013 from the
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania Department of the Auditor General. Motion carried.



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

Finance & Personnel Committee — Mr. Roth

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to enter into an agreement
authorizing the York Adams Tax Bureau (YATB) to administer, mail and collect the
Local Services Tax and the Business Privilege Taxes for the Borough of Hanover.
Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to approve the request of Firefighter
Anthony Clousher for reimbursement of funds from Waldorf College in his pursuit of an
Associate or Bachelor Degree in Fire Science or Emergency Management, provided the
proper agreement is submitted for reimbursements, indicating a minimum of three (3)
years employment with the Borough of Hanover after he attains his respective degree.
Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to authorize the proper officers of
The Borough of Hanover in coordination with the proper officers of The Township of
Penn to formulate a new Firefighters Eligibility List for a period of three (3) years.
Motion carried. : '

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to enter into the following leases for
Hanover Market House stalls:

Name Number Stalls Term Description
Brenda Christ 1 Stall 1 year Candles, scented items
Karen Jeffers 2 Stalls 1 year Organic Products

Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Funke to award the bid for the Transfer Station
Hauling Contract to KBS, Inc., Thomasville, PA, low bidder under Alternate B in the
amount of $154.50 per trip from April 1, 2015 to March 31, 2016; $159.50 per trip from
April 1, 2016 to March 31, 2017; and $164.50 per trip from April 1, 2017 to March 31,
2018; all in accordance with bid specifications. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to ratify the actions of the proper
officers of The Borough of Hanover in making budget adjustments for 2014 associated
with the York County Library System management agreement and fundraising efforts
regarding the Guthrie Memorial Library. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke to approve the request of Police
Officer Joseph Campo for reimbursement of $4,250.00 toward his Master’s degree in
Forensic Psychology with Walden University, per his signed agreement to remain
employed with The Borough of Hanover for a period of three (3) years following
completion of his education. Motion carried.

Planning & Traffic Committee — Mr. Morris

It was moved by Mr. Morris, seconded by Mr. Roth to approve the Final Subdivision
Plan for Kenneth A Kuhn, to subdivide the lot at 715 Carlisle Street (Parcel #0111) into
two lots located in the Local Business and Office-Apartment districts. Both lots will have
frontage on Carlisle Street. Plans sealed by Reginald F Baugher, Professional Land
Surveyor with Hanover Land Services, Inc., bearing file number E-5663, dated
1/29/2013, last revised 2/13/2015. Motion carried.

Public Service Committee — Mr. Eline

It was moved by Mr. Eline, seconded by Mr. Funke to approve the Special Event
Application submitted by Christy Hughes, Westminster, Maryland for the Race for Lori
Memorial 5K Fun Run/Walk on Saturday, August 15, 2015 from 6:00 AM to 10:00 AM
and use of Moul Field Recreational Area with bathrooms, with the following conditions
attached:



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

Public Service Committee — Mr. Eline

a. Race start time begins promptly at 8:00 AM or prior.

b. Sidewalks are not blocked for use by other pedestrians.

c. Borough streets used are closed to all vehicular traffic during the race event;

flagman are placed at barricades within the Borough to protect runners.

Race events are completed and streets reopened no later than 10:30 AM.

e. A certificate of insurance is provided naming The Borough of Hanover as a
co-insured for the event.

f. All food vendors to obtain all proper health licensing prior to the event.

g. Your organization is responsible for cleaning bathrooms before and after the
event.

h. Area is policed for litter following the event.

o

Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Eline, seconded by Mrs. Yingling to approve the request of Delone
Catholic High School to reserve the West Hanover Street tennis courts for the Delone
Catholic Boys’ Tennis Team for practices starting March 2, 2015 through April 30, 2015
from 3:00 PM to 5:30 PM and home matches from 3:00 PM to 7:00 PM on the following
dates: ‘

Tuesday, March 10, 2015 Tuesday, March 31, 2015
Tuesday, March 17, 2015 Tuesday, April 7, 2015
Thursday, March 26, 2015 Monday, April 13, 2015

provided a certificate of insurance is submitted naming The Borough of Hanover as
additional insured, and the areas are policed for litter following the events as per their
letter of request dated February 9, 2015. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Eline, seconded by Mrs. Yingling to approve the request of the RH
Sheppard Company, Inc., 101 Philadelphia Street, Hanover, PA to hold their annual
Easter Egg hunt at Moul Field on Saturday, March 28, 2015 from 8:00 AM to 10:00 AM,
per their special event permit application received February 23, 2015, provided a
certificate of insurance is submitted naming The Borough of Hanover as an additional
insured, the area is policed for litter following the event and any children in the
playground area may be invited to participate. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Eline, seconded by Mrs. Yingling to extend the agreement for the
PA Blaze Girls Fastpitch to lease the. concession stand at Moul Field for the 2015
season at a rate of $150.00, provided they agree to open and clean the bathrooms, and
open the concession stand for all scheduled events with the exception of July 4" for the
Liberty Day celebration. Motion carried.

It was moved by Mr. Eline, seconded by Mrs. Yingling to approve the request of Alan
Felix for the Bulldog Baseball Club to use two (2) fields at Good Field Baseball Complex
and bathrooms on weeknights March 10" through July 23, 2015 at a charge of
$250.00 provided a certificate of insurance naming The Borough of Hanover as
additional insured is submitted, and fields are maintained as per their letter of request
dated February 23, 2015 and this approval does not interfere with Borough run
programs. (The request to use Utz field or the lower field is denied due to pending field
construction.) Motion carried.

Water & Sewer Committee — Mrs. Yingling

It was moved by Mrs. Yingling, seconded by Mr. Eline to grant St. Bartholomew's
Church the use of the second parking lot at Long Arm Dam on Grand Valley Road, up
from Leppo Road for an Easter Sunrise Service Sunday, April 5, 2015 6:00 AM to 8:00
AM provided the area is cleaned up after the service and returned to its previous
condition following the event. Motion carried.



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

Water & Sewer Committee — Mrs. Yingling

It was moved by Mrs. Yingling, seconded by Mr. Funke to grant the request of Grace
United Church of Christ, 100 Fourth Street, to hold Easter Sunrise Services Sunday,
April 5, 2015 6:00 AM to 8:00 AM adjacent the dam breast at Long Arm Dam in the
parking lot provided the area is cleaned up after the service and returned to its previous
condition following the event. Motion carried.

MAYOR’S REPORT

Mayor Adams reported he attended the Downtown Familiarization Walk on January 30"
with Manager Krebs and President Gerken; and on February 20" he attended the Go
Red Luncheon at the Hanover Country Club. Mayor Adams called for all in attendance
to observe a moment of silence in memory of former Councilman Hufnagle who recently
passed away.

VIDEO REPORT

Water Distribution Supervisor Ault described recent photos of the spillway at Long Arm
Dam where ice has continuously frozen around a large valve; crews have had to keep
jackhammering the ice away so the valve would not break; water main break along
McKinley Avenue; water main break at library where the new paving had to be
excavated in order to make repairs. Manager Krebs showed photos of the new bucket
truck which has finally arrived; and the new garage door at the Tanger building.
Manager Krebs thanked the Public Works staff, Water Department staff, Fire
Department and Police Department for their diligent and dedicated work to keep
operations moving during this unusually cold February. There have been five (5) water
main breaks since last weekend, where crews are called at all hours to keep the water
system in operation.

OTHER MATTERS

New Business

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Funke, to accept, with regret, the retirement
request of Firefighter Fred Sentz, after thirty-five (35) years of service to the Hanover
Borough Fire Department, effective April 10, 2015. Motion carried.

Communications

Manager Krebs stated that Zachary Steckler recently passed a significant exam in
pursuit of his engineering certification and congratulated him, even though he could not
attend this evening’'s meeting.

Mr. Eline commended the police department for their dedication to the community.

Adjournment

President Gerken thanked all who attended this evening. A motion was made by Mr.
Funke, seconded by Mr. Eline to adjourn the meeting at 7:30 PM. Motion carried.

Respectfully submitted,

§) /Moy /027
Dorothy C. Miller
‘Borough Secretary



Pre-mixed Bituminous Material

Alternate #1

F.O.B. Plant

ID2 Surface Course (SRL Type M)

ID2 Base Course

Pre-Mixed Bituminous

Stock Pile Material

Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC)
1D3 Surface Course

9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

19 mm Superpave Surface Course
(0.3 fo 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

25 mm Superpave Base Course
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

Grand Total - Alternate #1

Distance of Plant from Hanover Square is

Alternate #2

F.O.B. Job (in 3 mile radius

of Hanover Center Square)

1D2 (SRL-Type "M" Aggregate)

ID2 (SRL- Type Blend "H" & "M" Aggregate)
ID2 Base Course

Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC)

ID3 Surface Course

9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

19 mm Superpave Surface Course
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

25 mm Superpave Base Course
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified)

Grand Total - Alternate #2

Add charge per mile for each mile over

3 mile radpﬁ lrcoa e's_l Eﬂé’é’sesrfif?’b‘?éﬁé)’ Lwarded at public meeting

2-25-15 6:00 PM

Approx.

Quantity
370 ton
200 ton

435 ton
520 ton
250 ton
790 ton

255 ton

800 ton

Approx.
Quantity
250 ton

50 ton
50 ton
250 ton

50 ton
3,175 ton

200 ton

1100 ton

BID TABULATION SHEET
BIDS AWARDED WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
: l |

miles miles miles

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
. | | l
. | l l
) l | |
. | | |
) | | i
) | l l
) | | |
) | ! |

Per ton mile Per ton mile Per ton mile




Crushed Stone

Purchase Product (PA DOT
No. or AASHTO No.)

Screenings (AASHTO 10)

PA 2A & RC Stone

Sand & Crushed Stone
(PA anti-skid type 2)

1B Stone (AASHTO #8) &
HE6 Stone (AASHTO #9)

2B Stone (AASHTO #57)

All other stone including:
4" Ballast (AASHTO #1)
(AASHTO #3)

Rip-Rap (Including R-5 & R-4)

Distance of bidder bin from Hanover Square

Approx
Quantity

525 ton

5,400 ton

1,950 ton

695 ton

630 ton

1,275 ton

345 ton

BID TABULATION SHEET

UARY 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

BIDS AWARDED WEDNESDAY, FEBR

Kinsley Materials
P. O. Box 2886
York, Pa. 17405

York Building Products
950 Smile Way
York, Pa. 17404

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price

$9.75 Net price per ton

$5.50 Net price per ton

$10.25 Net price per ton

- $10.50 Net price per ton

$9.75 Net price per ton

$9.75 Net price per ton

$15.50 Net price per ton

17 miles

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price

$10.00 Net price per tor

$7.85 Net price per tor

$10.55 Net price per tor

$11.10 Net price per tor

$10.00 Net price per tor

$10.00 Net price per tor

$13.60 Net price per tor

12 miles

Price per ton for delivery only in full truck load quantities to job locations as specified at time of delivery in:

. Hanover Borough

. Penn Township

. Conewago Township

. McSherrystown Borough
. Union Township

West Manheim Township
. Germany Township

OmMmMmoOO W >

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting

$5.70 Perton

$5.70 Perton

$5.70 Perton

$5.70 Perton
$6.35 Perton

$6.35 Perton

$6.35 Perton

2-25-15 6:00 PM

$4.10 Perton
$4.10 Perton
$4.45 Perton
$4.65 Perton
$5.00 Perton

$4.10 Perton
$5.75 Perton

Unit Price

NAME OF BIDDER

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

Net price per ton

miles

Per ton
Per ton
Per ton

Per ton
Per ton

Per ton
Per ton



Petroleum Products

Approx

Gasoline Quantity
1A. Regular Lead-Free Minimum 87 Octane 96,500 gal.
1B. Premium or Super Lead-Free minimum 92 Octane 8,100 gal.
Motor Qil
2A. #5-20 Motor Oil Universal, muiltigrade/55 gal. drums 110 gal.
2B. #15-40 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade in bulk 1,000 gal.
2C. #15-40 Motor Oit Universal, multigrade in 55 gal drums 385 gal.
2D. #10-20 Hydraulic Oil/low foaming action, in bulk 600 gal.
2E. #10-20 Hydraulic Qil/low foaming action, in 55 gal drums 55 gal.
Chassis Lubricant
3. Multi-purpose Grease (meets new car warranty) 360 lbs.

in 120 Ib. No-return drums
Diesel Oil
4. Diesel #2 Straight Run 97,000 gal.
Fuel Qil
5. Fuel Oil #2 13,500 gal.
Kerosene
6. Standard Kerosene 110 gal.
Dexron Il Transmission Fluid
7. Transmission Fluid-Dexron 11, in 55 gal. drums 110 gal.
Synthetic Gear Qil
8A. Mobil SCH 634 Synthetic Lubricant, or equal, 55 gal.

in 55 gal. drums

Distance of Bidders Location from Hanover Center Square:

BID TABULATION SHEET
BIDS AWARDED WEDNESDAY, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

0 0. lew Oxforc 35 onestown, Pa 1703 deric|
AME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER
Trade Name  Price/Gal. Trade Name Price/Gal. Trade Name Price/Gal. Trade Name Price/Gal.
Unbranded | $1.6609 |  nobid no bid
Unbranded $1.9820 no bid no bid
Conoco Super
no bid no nid * n. Bl:5w20 Syn.Bl. 5w20 8.28 gal
Peak :
no bid no bid 15w40 CJ-4 7.74 gal
Peak
no bid no bid 15w40 CJ4
no bid no bid Peak AW46 er
Conoco
no bid no bid Powertran FWID 7.89 gal
ConocoMultiplex
no bid /Ib. no bid Ib. Red 2.511b.
Unbranded $1.8976 no bid no bid
Unbranded $1.9115 no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid
Conoco Super ATF
no bid no bid 8.38 gal
Conoco Syncon
no bid no bid R&O 460 27.72 gal
1 1/2 miles 6.75 miles 68 miles various warehouses miles

100 Kindig Lane, Hanover, Pa

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting
2-25-15 6:00 PM



Snow & Ice Rock Salt

Alternate #1

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk Quantity

quantities to be delivered in

minimum quantities of forty

thousand (40,000) pound dump

truck loads. FOB Bidder's Plant

Delivered before 7/1/15 2,722 ton
OR

Delivered before (1) ?\{1/15 2,722 ton

Delivered after 10/1/15 2,722 ton

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square

Bins are located at:

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is
(One-way travel time)

BID TABULATION SHEET

BIDS AWARDED WEDNESDAY, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

Unit Price Total Price

Cargill, Inc.
Morton Salt, inc. 24950 Country Club Road
123 N. Wacker Drive Suite 450

Chicago, IL 60606-1743 North Olmsted, OH 44070

Compass Minerals

9900 West 109th Street

Suite 100

Qverland Park, KS 66210

0O

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price

$97.05 | $264,170.10

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Alternate #2
Quantity
Standard Calcium Chloride in
50 to 100 Ib. bags or drums.
FOB Destination 2 ton

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal.

no bid

|

nobid | o bid |

no bid

$80.37 | $218.767.14  no bid | no bid l
$97.05 | $264,170.10 $80.37 | $218.767.14  no bid ] no bid |
$97.05 | $264,170.10 $81.37 | $221,489.14  no bid | no bid l
52.78 miles 45 miles miles miles
1635 E. Patapsco Ave.,
Baltimore, MD. 21226-1101Baltimore MD.
67 minutes 60 minutes minutes minutes

Unit Price Total Price

no bid

no bid

no bid | no bid l

no bid

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting

2-25-15 6:00 PM




Snow & Ice Rock Salt

Alternate #1

Snow & lce Rock Salt in bulk Quantity
guantities to be delivered in

minimum quantities of forty

thousand (40,000) pound dump

truck loads. FOB Bidder's Plant

Delivered before 7/1/15 2,722 ton
OR

Delivered before 10/1/15 2,722 ton
OR

Delivered after 10/1/15 2,722 ton

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square
Bins are located at:

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is
(One-way travel time)

Alternate #2
Quantity
Standard Calcium Chloride in
50 to 100 Ib. bags or drums.
FOB Destination 2 ton

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal.

BID TABULATION SHEET

BIDS OPENED WEDNESDAY, February 4, 2015 at

Calcium Chiloride Sales, Inc.
713 West Main Street
Grove City, Pa. 16127

Detroit Salt Company LLC
12841 Sanders Street
Detroit, MI 48217

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

NAME OF BIDDER

Unit Price Total Price

nobid | no bid | no bid | | ]
nobid | no bid | no bid | l l
nobid | no bid | no bid l | |
miles miles miles miles miles
minutes minutes minutes minutes minutes
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
no bid | no bid | | l
1.70/gal | $6,800.00 no bid | no bid | |

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting 2-25-15 6:00 PM



Chemical Bids

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items

BID TABULATION SHEET
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

USALCO Baitimore

Calcium Chloride Sales * :Plant, LLC

713 West Main Street
Grove City, Pa. 16127

Baltimore, MD. 21226

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

NAME OF BIDDER

A. 150 Ib. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine

B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine

C. HTH tablets in 100 Ib. drums

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads

E. Soda Ash in 50 Ib. bags

F. Copper Sulphate in 50 Ib. bags

G. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in 150 Ib. drums only

H. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk

I. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads

J. Sulphur Dioxide in one\(’l) ton containers

K. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk

L. Liquid Methanol in bulk

M. Sodium Permanganate in 550 Ib. drums

N. Caustic Soda in bulk

no bid per |b. no bid per |b. no bid per Ib.

no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib.

no bid per cwt per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.
no bid per cwt $31.00 per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per gal. no bid per gal $0.954 per gal.
no bid per ton no bid per ton no bid per ton
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.
no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib.

no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.

Total Alternate #1 Bid for Items A through N

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting
2-25-2015 at 6:00 p.m.

$348.00

no bid

$265.00

$54.00

no bid

no bid

$1.29

$1.52

per cwt

per gal.

Evoqua Water
Technologies LLC

2650 Tallevest Road
Sarasota, FL. 34243

NAME OF BIDDER

no bid

no bid

no bid

$0.691

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

per ib.
per lb.
per cwt
per gal.
per cwt
per cwt
per cwt
per cwt
per gal.
per ton
per gal.
per gal.
per Ib.

pergal.



Chemical Bids

NAME OF BIDDER

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items

A. 150 Ib. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine no bid per Ib.
B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine no bid per Ib.
C. HTH tablets in 100 Ib. drums no bid per cwt

*

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads

E. Soda Ash in 50 Ib. bags no bid per cwt
F. Copper Sulphate in 50 Ib. bags no bid per cwt
G. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in 150 Ib. drums only no bid per cwt
H. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk no bid per cwt

I. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads

J. Sulphur Dioxide in one (1) ton containers no bid per ton
K. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk no bid per gal.
L. Liquid Methanol in bulk no bid per gal.
M. Sodium Permanganate in 550 lb. drums no bid per Ib.

N. Caustic Soda in bulk no bid per gal.

Total Alternate #1 Bid for items A through N

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting
2-25-2015 at 6:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION SHEET
Y, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

Kuehne Chemical Co, Inc.
86 North Hackensack Ave
South Kerny, NJ 07032
NAME OF BIDDER

NAME OF BIDDER

Chemtrade Chemicals
90 East Halsey Rd
Parsippany, NJ 07054

NAME OF BIDDER

Brenntag Northeast, Inc.
81 W, Huller Lane

Reading, Pa.
NAME OF BIDDER

19605

no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib.
$1.00 per ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib.
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt $28.90 per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt no bid per cwt
(for conversion purposes only price equates to $409.00/dry ton)
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. $1.1043 per gal. no bid per gal.
no bid per ton bid per ton no bid per ton no bid per ton
no bid per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal.
* Monthly Methanex NDRP+.15/gal. 7,000 gal/min. orders
no bid per gal. no bid per gal no bid per gal. 1.25+0.15=1.40* per gal.
no bid per |b. no bid per b no bid per Ib. no bid per Ib.
(no pre-bid inspection sign-off)
$2.5559 per gal. no bid per gal no bid per gal. no bid per gal.




Chemical Bids

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual ltems

A. 150 Ib. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine

B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine

C. HTH tablets in 100 Ib. drums

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads
E. Soda Ash in 50 Ib. bags

F. Copper Sulphate in 50 Ib. bags

G. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in 150 Ib. drums only
H. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk

I. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads

J. Sulphur Dioxide in one (1) ton containers

K. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk

$1.0376 per Ib.
no bid per Ib.
$435.71 per cwt
no bid per gal.
$30.57 per cwt
no bid per cwt
(15gal drum net 125lbs - min 11 drums delivery)
$56.85 percwt -
no bid per cwt
no bid per gal.
no bid per ton
no bid per gal.
no bid per gal.

L. Liquid Methanol in bulk
M. Sodium Permanganate in 550 Ib. drums

N. Caustic Soda in bulk

Total Alternate #1 Bid for items A through N

(o) n

(min. 5cyls/delivery)

BID TABULATION SHEET
y, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

NAME OF BIDDER

no bid

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting

2-25-2015 at 6:00 p.m.

Gulbrandsen Tech.

2 Main Street

P.O. Box 5523
Clinton, NJ 08809

NAME OF BIDDER

** Holland Co., Inc.
153 Howland Ave
Adams, MA 01220-1199
NAME OF BIDDER

no bid per Ib.
no bid per Ib.
no bid per cwt
no bid per gal.
no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt
no bid per cwt
no bid per gal.
no bid per ton
(minimum 4000 gals per load)
1.51/ gal per gal.
no bid per gal.
no bid per Ib.
no bid per gal.

(No bid bond)**

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

(No bid bond)**
$1.40

no bid

(No bid bond)**
$2.25

no bid

no bid

no bid

per Ib.
per |b.
per cwt
per gal.
per cwt

per cwt

per cwt -

per cwt
per gal.
per ton
per gal.
per gal.
per ib.

per gal.

NAME OF BIDDER

per Ib.

per ib.

per cwt

per gal.

per cwt

per cwt

per cwt

per cwt

per gal.

per ton

per gal.

per gal.

per ib.

per gal.

NAME OF BIDDER

per Ib.

per Ib.

per cwt
per gal.
per cwt
per cwt
per cwt
per cwt
per gal.
per ton
per gal.
per gal.
per Ib.

per gal.



BID TABULATION SHEET
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

Traffic Line Painting

Traffic & Safety Signs Alpha Space Contr Midlantic Marking Inc
703 Terminal Way 1580 Gabler Road P.O. Box 7997
Kennett Square, Pa 19348  Chambersburg, Pa. 17201 Gaithersburg, MD 20898
Center Line Painting NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER
Two - four (4") inch yellow lines $0.089 perLF $0.0978 per LF | $0.0975 per LF per LF per LF
Total Price for 88 Miles: $41,352.96 $45,441.79 $45,302.40
Lane & Edge Line Painting
One - four (4") inch white line $0.048 per LF $0.0489 per LF $0.0500 per LF per LF per LF
(solid or dashed) ‘
Total Price for 101 Miles: $25,597 .44 $26,077.39 $26,664.00
Total Price $66,950.40 $71,519.18 $71,966.40

* recommend 2nd low bidder award due to past poor job performance of low bidder

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting 2-25-15 6:00 PM



BID TABULATION SHEET
BIDS AWARDED WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 25, 2015 at 6:00 PM

WATER BORNE TRAFFIC PAINT PRODUCTS

Ennis Paint, Inc.

115 Todd Court

Thomasville, NC 27360
NAME OF BIDDER

Water Borne Pavement Markings Approximate

As per Bid Specifications: Quantities Trade Name Unit Price

A. White (5 gallon pails) 590 gallons no bid per gal.
B. Yellow (5 gallon pails) 215 gallons no bid per gal.
C. Blue (5 gallon pails) 30 galions no bid per gal.

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Water Borne Pavement Markings Approximate

As per Bid Specifications: Quantities Trade Name Unit Price Trade Name Unit Price

A. White (5 gallon pails) 590 gallons per gal. per gal.
B. Yellow (5 gallon pails) 215 gallons per gal. per gal.
C. Blue (5 gallon pails) 30 gallons per gal. per gal.

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at public meeting 2-25-15 6:00 PM

NAME OF BIDDER

Trade Name

Unit Price

NAME OF BIDDER

Trade Name

Unit Price

per gal.
per gal.

per gal.

per gal.
per gal.

per gal.



BIDS OPENED WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 25, 2015 AT 7:00 P.M.

TRANSFER TRAILER HAULING

Republic Services
3730 Sandhurst Drive
York, PA 17406

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Transport Hanover Borough Trailers loaded with Municipal

Solid Waste from Hanover to York for period April 1, 2015 to
March 31, 2016 NO BID $ 154.50

Cost per trip: NO BID $ 154.50

ALTERNATE "A"

Cost per trip to transport Hanover Borough Trailers loaded with
Municipal Solid Waste from Hanover to York:

Cost per trip April 1, 2015 to March 31, 2016: NO BID $ 154.50
Cost per trip April 1, 2016 to March 31, 2017: NO BID $ 159.50
Total cost for two (2) years NO BID $ 314.00

ALTERNATE "B"

Cost per trip to transport Hanover Borough Trailers loaded with
Municipal Solid Waste from Hanover to York:

Cost per trip April 1, 2015 to March 31, 2016: NO BID *
Cost per trip April 1, 2016 to March 31, 2017: NO BID *
Cost per trim April 1, 2017 to March 31, 2018: NO BID
Total cost for two (3) years NO BID

*Indicates successbul bidder at meeting held February 25, 2015



