
Council Chamber, February 24, 2016 

President Noble convened the public meeting of Hanover Borough Council in the Hanover 
Municipal Building, 44 Frederick Street, Hanover, Pennsylvania at 6:00PM as advertised. 

The meeting started with the Pledge of Allegiance followed by a moment of silent prayer. 

Roll Call: The following representatives of municipalities were present this evening: 

Conewago Township- Manager Krebs, Supervisors Brillhart, Knight and 
LeGore were present. This represented a quorum. 

Hanover Borough - Council Members present were; Mr. Angel, Mr. 
Baumgardner, Mr. Marcoccio, Mr. Mclin, Mr. Noble, Mr. Reichart, Mr. Roth 
and Mr. Shea; Mayor Adams; Solicitor Yingst; Manager Ford and Secretary 
Neiderer. Mr. Funke and Ms. libertini were absent. The Secretary 
announced a quorum. 

Germany Township - Supervisors Mr. Osborne and Mr. Smith were 
present. This represented a quorum. 

McSherrystown Borough - Manager Cook; Council Members Mr. Bolton, 
Mr. Calderone, Mr. Duvall, Mr. Forbes and Mr. Neidererr were present. This 
represented a quorum. 

Penn Township - Manager Rodgers; Commissioners present were Mr. 
Felix, Mr. Heilman and Mr. Klunk. This represented a quorum. 

Union Township- Supervisor Mr. Freet was in attendance, but no voting 
could occur due to lack of a quorum. 

West Manheim Township- Supervisors present were Mr. DeGennaro, Mr. 
Hartlaub and Mr. Staaf. This represented a quorum. 

CITIZENS WITH ITEMS OF BUSINESS TO BE BROUGHT BEFORE THE 
MUNICIPALITIES 

• Hanover Borough - Mr. Tim Seitz, 230 Primrose Lane, Hanover, PA noted that it 
was good to have all the neighboring municipalities in attendance at one meeting 
and working together. 

President Noble asked if any of the other municipalities had citizens with business 
to be brought before their municipal authorities. None was presented. 

REGIONAL BID AWARDS FOR COMMONLY USED SUPPLIES AND SERVICES 

Bituminous Paving Materials 

Hanover Borough- It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to accept the 
bid and award the contract to York Materials Group LLC for premixed bituminous 
concrete under Alternate #1 and Alternate #2 for the following bid prices as quoted: 

FOB Plant - Alternate #1 

1. ID2 Surface Course (SRL Type M) $ 53.55 per ton. 
2. ID2 Base Course $ 46.00 per ton. 
3. Pre-mixed Bituminous Stock Pile Material $100.00 per ton. 
4. Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) $ 45.00 per ton. 
5. ID3 Surface Course $ 48.65 per ton. 
6. 9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course $ 53.55 per ton. 



Regional Bid Awards for Commonly Used Supplies and Services 

Bituminous Paving Materials 

7. 19 mm Superpave Surface Course $ 48.65 per ton. 
8. 25 mm Superpave Base Course $ 46.00 per ton. 

FOB Job - Alternate #2 

1. 102 (SRL Type M Aggregate)$ $ 58.05 per ton. 
2. Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) $ $ 49.50 per ton. 
3. 9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course$ $ 58.05 per ton. 
4. 19 mm Superpave Surface Course $ $ 53.15 per ton. 
5. 25 mm Superpave Base Course $ $ 50.50 per ton. 

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and that 
the proper officers be, and they hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the 
same. Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to accept 
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Crushed Stone 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin that Council 
accept the bid and award the contract for crushed stone to Vulcan Construction 
Materials LP for: 

1. Screenings (AASHTO 1 0) at a price of$ 10.25 per ton. 
2. PA 2A Stone at a price of$ 6.95 per ton. 
3. Sand and Crushed Stone Anti-skid Type 2 at a price of$ 11.25 per ton. 

4. 1B Stone (AASHTO #8) & HE6 Stone (AASHTO #9) at a price of$ 12.00 per 
ton. 

5. 2B Stone (AASHTO #57) at a price of$ 10.95 per ton. 

6. All other stone including 4-inch Ballast (AASHTO #1) - (AASHTO #3), at a price 
of$ 10.95 per ton. 

7. Rip-Rap at a price of$ 14.50 per ton. 

All FOB Plant and all in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the 
necessary bond and that the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute 
a contract for the same. Motion carried. 



Regional Bid Awards for Commonly Used Supplies and Services 

Crushed Stone 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to accept 
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Stone Delivery Prices 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin that Council 
accept the price per ton for delivery only in full truck load quantities to job locations as 
specified at time of delivery in: 

a. HANOVER BOROUGH: $2.35 

b. PENN TOWNSHIP: $2.40 

c. CONEWAGO TOWNSHIP: $ 1.70 

d. MCSHERRYSTOWN BOROUGH: $ 1.70 

e. UNION TOWNSHIP: $2.60 

f. WEST MANHEIM TOWNSHIP: $2.60 

g. GERMANY TOWNSHIP $3.40 

Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to accept 
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 



Regional Bid Awards for Commonly Used Supplies and Services 

Crushed Stone 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Petroleum Products 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to accept the 
bid award for petroleum products to the following at the bid prices as quoted: 

1A. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions/dba Aero Energy for regular lead-
free minimum 87 octane gasoline for a price of $ 1.302 per gallon. 

1 B. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions/dba Aero Energy for premium or 
super, minimum 92 octane gasoline for a price of $ 1.754 per gallon. 

2A. To PPC Lubricants. Inc. for #5-20 motor oil in 55-gallon drums 
for a price of$ 5.45 per gallon. 

2B. 

2C. 

20. 

To PPC Lubricants. Inc. 
$ 5.95 per gallon. 

for #15-40 motor oil in bulk for a price of 

To PPC Lubricants. Inc. for #15-40 motor oil in 55-gallon drums for a 
price of$ 6.55 per gallon. 

To PPC Lubricants. Inc. 
bulk for a price of$ 4.20 

for #1 0-20 hydraulic oil/low foaming action in 
per gallon. 

2E. To PPC Lubricants for #1 0-20 hydraulic oil/low foaming action in 55-

3. 

gallon drums for a price of$ 4.80 per gallon. 

To PPC Lubricants for multi-purpose grease for a price of$ 
pound. 

1.91 per 

4. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions dba/Aero Energy for diesel oil #2 for a 
price of$ 1.3263 per gallon. 

5. To Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions dba/Aero Energy for fuel oil #2 for a 

7. 

price of$ 1.3439 per gallon. 

(Item 6 intentionally skipped- no bids on kerosene) 

To PPC Lubricants 
drums for a price of$ 5.60 

for transmission fluid-Dexron II in 55-gallon 
per gallon. 

8A. To PPC Lubricants for Mobile SCH 634 synthetic lubricant, or equal, in 
55 gal drums for a price of$ 26.65 per gallon. 

All in accordance with specifications and that the proper officers be, and hereby are, 
authorized to execute a contract for the same. Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 
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Petroleum Products 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough atthe bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to award the 
bid for snow and ice rock salt and calcium chloride at the following quoted bid prices: 

Alternate #1 - To American Rock Salt Co LLC for bulk snow and ice rock salt for a 
price of: $ 70.70 per ton. 

Alternate #2- To Harvey Salt Company, Inc. for Calcium Chloride in 50 to 100 
pound bags or drums for a price of$ 659.20 per ton FOB Borough's 
and/or Township's Public Works buildings. 

To Envirotech Services. Inc. for Liquid Calcium Chloride 32% mixture 
at a price of ll.J2 per gallon FOB Borough's and/or Township's 
Public Works Buildings. 

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and that 
the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the same. 
Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to accept 
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Chemical Products 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to award 
chemical products as quoted under Alternate #1 as follows: 

1. To UNIVAR USA. Inc. for 150 lb. cylinders of liquid chlorine at a price 
of$ 0.79 per lb. 

2. To UNIVAR USA Inc. for one-ton containers of liquid chlorine 
at a price of$ 0.40 per lb. 
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Chemical Products 

3. To Main Pool & Chemical for HTH tablets in 100 lb. drums at a 
price of$ 329.00 per 100 lb. (CWT). 

4. To Evogua Water Technologies LLC for ferrous sulphate liquid in full tanker 
loads at a price of$ 0.669 per gallon. 

5. To Main Pool & Chemical Co .. Inc. for copper sulphate in 50 
lb. bags at a price of$ 235.00 per 100 lb. (CWT). 

6. To UNIVAR USA. Inc. for hydrofluosilicic acid in bulk at a price 

7. 

8. 

9. 

of$ 31.71 per 100 lb. (CWT). 

To USALCO Baltimore Plant LLC for liquid alum in full tanker 
loads at a price of$ 0.7614 per gallon. 

To UNIVAR USA Inc. for sulphur dioxide in one-ton 
containers at a price of$ 1.380.00 per ton. 

for liquid To USALCO Baltimore Plant LLC 
polyaluminum chloride in bulk at a price of$ 1.065 per gallon. 

10. To Main Pool & Chemical Co .. Inc. for Sodium 
Permanganate in 550 lb. drums at a price of $ 0.975 per lb. 

11. To UNIVAR USA Inc. for Caustic Soda in bulk at a price of 
$ 1.64 per gallon. 

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and that 
the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the same. 
Motion carried. 

PENN TOWNSHIP: Consideration of a motion to accept the motion of Hanover Borough 
and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid price as quoted 
on Item #9 only. Motion carried. 

Traffic Line Painting 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to award the 
bid for traffic line painting to the following at the following bid prices: 

1. To Alpha Space Control. Inc. for Center Line Painting: Two (2) four-
inch yellow lines at a price of$ 0.0978 per If. 

2. To Alpha Space Control. Inc. for Edge Line Painting: One (1) four-
inch white line (solid or dashed) at a price of$ 0.0475 per If. 

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and that 
the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the same. 
Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to accept 
the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 
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Traffic Line Painting 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to accept the 
motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of Hanover 
Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Water Borne Traffic Paint 

Hanover Borough: It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to award the 
bid for water borne traffic paint to the following at the following bid prices: 

1. To Mike Cummings Company. Inc., Littlestown, Pennsylvania for white paint in 5 
gallon pails at a price of $13.46 per gallon. 

2. To Mike Cummings Company. Inc., Littlestown, Pennsylvania for yellow paint in 5 
gallon pails at a price of $13.78 per gallon. 

3. To Mike Cummings Company, Inc., Littlestown, Pennsylvania for blue paint in 5 
gallon pails at a price of $13.38 per gallon. 

All in accordance with specifications and upon receipt of the necessary bond; and that 
the proper officers be, and hereby are, authorized to execute a contract for the same. 
Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per bid motion of 
Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to accept the motion of Hanover Borough and award the contract as per 
bid motion of Hanover Borough at the bid prices as quoted. Motion carried. 

Motion to Adjourn the Joint Bid Award Meeting: 

Hanover Borough: President Noble asked if there were any questions regarding the 
bids. There being no questions, it was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Mclin to 
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15PM. Motion carried. 

Conewago Township: It was moved by Mr. Brillhart, seconded by Mr. LeGore to 
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15PM. 

Germany Township: It was moved by Mr. Smith, seconded by Mr. Osborne to adjourn 
the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15PM. 

McSherrystown Borough: It was moved by Mr. Bolton, seconded by Mr. Forbes to 
adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15PM. Motion carried. 

Penn Township: It was moved by Mr. Klunk, seconded by Mr. Felix to adjourn the 
Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15PM. Motion carried. 



Motion to Adjourn the Joint Bid Award Meeting: 

West Manheim Township: It was moved by Mr. Hartlaub, seconded by Mr. 
DeGennaro to adjourn the Regional Joint Bid Award meeting at 6:15 PM. Motion 
carried. 

Hanover Borough Council President Noble thanked the municipalities for their attendance 
this evening and announced there would be a brief intermission before continuing with 
regular Council business for The Borough of Hanover. 

INTERMISSION 

HANOVER BOROUGH COUNCIL MEETING 

Mr. Angel, Mr. Baumgardner, Mr. Marcoccio, Mr. Mclin, Mr. Noble, Mr. Reichart, Mr. Roth 
and Mr. Shea returned to the meeting; and Ms. Libertini entered the meeting; Mayor 
Adams; Solicitor Yingst; Manager Ford and Secretary Neiderer returned to the meeting 
and it resumed at 6:30 PM to the Hanover Borough Business portion of the meeting. 

PRELIMINARY MATTERS & OFFICERS' REPORTS 

Mayor Adams welcomed Cub Scout Pack #1 07 Den 5 who presented the colors and led 
the Pledge of Allegiance and Moment of Silence. 

CITIZENS WITH ITEMS OF BUSINESS TO BE BROUGHT BEFORE THE BOROUGH 

Mr. Bill Wierman, 536 West Walnut Street, was present to address a sewer back up that 
occurred February 3rd. He questioned the responsibility of the excavation and repair of 
the lateral on West Walnut Street which connects to the sewer main on Kilpatrick Avenue 
which was repaired by his plumber. 

President Noble stated that the matter would be investigated and a response given to Mr. 
Wierman. President Noble thanked Mr. Wierman for bringing it to Council's attention. 

Mr. David Timothy Seitz, 230 Primrose Lane, also a member of the Hanover Borough 
Planning Commission addressed Council about his concern for the lack of regulations to 
govern the installation and operation of cell phone/communications towers; and asked 
about the status of the revision of the zoning ordinance in relation to this. He questioned 
the pending approval on Council's agenda this evening of the Miller Chemical Plant where 
a severe fire occurred in June of 2015 and now the plant is being rebuilt. Mr. Seitz stated 
that fertilizer plants should be regulated and wanted some assurance of safety. Mr. Seitz 
thanked all new Council members for their willingness to serve the community and 
thanked citizens for their attendance this evening. 

President Noble thanked Mr. Seitz for his concerns this evening. 

Public Safety Committee - Mr. Marcoccio: 

It was moved by Mr. Marcoccio, seconded by Mr. Roth to appoint Adriel Garibay, 
Hanover, PA to Probationary Firefighter effective March 14, 2016 under the rules and 
regulations of the Civil Service Commission. Motion carried. 

Mayor Adams administered the Oath of Office and Council welcomed Mr. Garibay and 
congratulated him on his new position. Motion carried. 



PRELIMINARY MATTERS & OFFICERS' REPORTS 

It was moved by Mr. Angel, seconded by Mr. Reichart to approve the minutes of the 
following Council Meetings: 

(a) January 27, 2016 
(b) February 3, 2016 

Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Shea, seconded by Mr. Reichart to approve the bills, the report of 
the Mayor and the report of the Fire Chief. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Angel, seconded by Mr. Reichart to approve the reports of the 
following Borough Administrators: 

a.) Borough Manager 
b.) Supervisor of Public Works 
c.) Superintendent of Water & Wastewater Treatment 
d.) Supervisor of Water Treatment Plant 
e.) Supervisor of Water Distribution 
f.) Supervisor of Water Meter Department 
g.) Engineering Department 
h.) Library Director 

President Noble and Mr. Shea commended Manager Ford on an excellent Borough 
Manager's report. Motion carried. 

REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES 

Finance & Personnel Committee - Mr. Mclin 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to ratify the action of the Borough 
Officers in making the following investments with People's Bank for a period of 29 days, 
January 31, 2016 to February 29, 2016 at an interest rate of 0.50%: 

Funds 

General Fund 

Sewer Fund 

Guthrie Memorial Library Fund 

Regional Wastewater Treatment Fund 

Market House Fund 

Liquid Fuels Fund 

Equipment Fund 

Local Services Tax Fund 

Business Privilege Tax Fund 

Leisure Services Fund 

Sewer Projects Fund 

Library Projects Fund 

Investments 

$3,431,200.00 

$1,407,000.00 

$0.00 

$508,300.00 

$45,900.00 

$0.00 

$66,800.00 

$437,200.00 

$439,500.00 

$45,700.00 

$0.00 

$13,700.00 



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES 

Finance & Personnel Committee - Mr. Mclin 

Funds 

Hanover Recreation Endowment Fund 

Water Revenue Fund 

Water Projects Fund 

Market House Reserve Fund 

Hanover Recreation Reserve Fund 

Library Endowment Fund 

Library Endowment Additional Investment 

2010 Water Bonds 

2013 Water Bonds 

2013 Sewer Bonds 

2013 General Bonds 

2015 General Bonds 

Total 

Motion carried. 

Investments 

$301,000.00 

$2,750,000.00 

$186,500.00 

$5,688.59 

$12,746.60 

$1,050,255.91 

$737.06 

$0.00 

$800,000.00 

$110,000.00 

$150,000.00 

$3,800,000.00 

$15.562.228.16 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to approve reimbursement to the 
following employees for their tuition for college courses successfully completed: 

a. Bryan Spickler Columbia Southern University $ 630.00 
- Fire Administration/Fire Investigation 

b. Zachary Steckler Penn State University 
- Civil Engineering 

c. Anthony Clousher Waldorf College 
- Fire Science 

Motion carried. 

$ 3,218.00 

$ 1,485.00 

If was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth for Mr. Jose A Gonzalez, Jr. to further 
his education with the University of Phoenix in pursuit of his Bachelor of Science degree 
in Criminal Justice Administration and to submit his receipts of successful completion of 
courses to Council for future reimbursement, as per signed agreement stating he agrees 
to be employed by Hanover Borough for a minimum of three (3) years following the 
completion of his degree. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to approve the following increases to 
the Baseball/Softball registration fees: 

a. Baseball/Softball: 
b. Morning League: 

Motion carried. 

Current Rate 
$10.00 
$10.00 

Proposed Rate 
$25.00 
$20.00 



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES 

Finance & Personnel Committee - Mr. Mclin 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to grant credits to sewer accounts, 
one time only, for leaks that did not enter the sewer system and have since been repaired: 

Account No. 
51-0228033-0 

Account No. 
51-0228035-0 

Motion carried. 

Name/Address 
Aiello's Custom Homes 
703 Blossom Drive 

Name/Address 
Aiello's Custom Homes 
707 Blossom Drive 

Credit Amount 
$167.75 

Credit Amount 
$406.65 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to authorize Borough staff to purchase 
two (2) interrogator (water meter) reading devices for the Hanover Borough Water 
Department in amount to not exceed $17,000 per the approved 2016 budget. Water 
Department Supervisor Mr. Sherman replied they must be ordered direct from the factory 
which takes three (3) to four (4) months for delivery. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to permit the Civil Service Commission 
to proceed with a promotional test for the position of Captain within the Hanover Fire 
Department. It will take approximately three (3) months to complete the process. Motion 
carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Mclin, seconded by Mr. Roth to move forward with the necessary 
procedures to place the sale of the 1996 E-ONE Aerial truck for bid. Chief Cromer noted 
sealed bids could be scheduled for opening at the April Council meeting. Motion carried. 

Planning Commission -James Roth 

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Reichart to approve the Final Land 
Development Plan for Miller Chemical & Fertilizer, LLC to construct a new manufacturing 
facility on the previous site at High Street and Radio Road, bearing project number 
153000, drawn by Gerald D. Funke, Professional Land Surveyor for Group Hanover, Inc., 
213 Carlisle Street, Hanover, PA, dated November 18, 2015. (All construction is in 
Conewago Township. A small portion of the parcel where the office is located lies within 
the Borough which was approved by the Hanover Borough Planning Commission.) Mr. 
Mclin asked if we had received any reimbursement yet, and Chief Cromer replied the 
Borough received approximately $11,000 for damaged equipment and overtime from the 
County. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Roth, seconded by Mr. Shea to approve the Final Subdivision Plan 
for Carole G. Zinn owner of 229 and 231 Broadway (Parcel# 0636 and 0637 respectively) 
for two (2) separate lots located in the 0-A (Office-Apartment) residential district, drawn 
by Edward L. Mort, Professional Land Surveyor for Group Hanover, Inc. 213 Carlisle 
Street, Hanover, PA bearing project number 152680, dated November 18, 2015. (Both 
properties are presently under one deed and owner would like to separate the two 
properties.) Motion carried. 

Public Service & Communications Committee - Mr. Shea 

It was moved by Mr. Shea, seconded by Mr. Roth to approve the request of the RH 
Sheppard Company, Inc., 101 Philadelphia Street, Hanover, PA to hold their annual 
Easter Egg hunt at Maul Field on Saturday, March 19, 2016 from 8:30 AM to 11:30 AM, 
per their special event permit application received February 23, 2016, provided a 
certificate of insurance is submitted naming The Borough of Hanover as an additional 
insured, the area is policed for litter following the event and any children in the playground 
area may be invited to participate. Motion carried. 



REPORTS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES 

Public Service & Communications Committee - Mr. Shea 

It was moved by Mr. Shea, seconded by Mr. Roth to grant the request of the Hanover 
Chamber of Commerce to hold their annual Dutch Festival on Saturday, July 30, 2016 in 
the downtown area as per their Special Event Permit Application and payment of 
applicable fees, with certificate of insurance naming The Borough of Hanover as 
additional insured for the event. Motion carried. 

Water & Sewer Committee - Mr. Reichart 

It was moved by Mr. Reichart, seconded by Mr. Roth to grant St. Bartholomew's Church 
the use of the second parking lot at Long Arm Dam on Grand Valley Road, up from Leppo 
Road for an Easter Sunrise Service Sunday, March 27, 2016 6:00 AM to 8:00 AM 
provided the area is cleaned up after the service and returned to its previous condition 
following the event. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Reichart, seconded by Mr. Roth to grant the request of Grace United 
Church of Christ, 100 Fourth Street, to hold Easter Sunrise Services Sunday, March 27, 
2016 6:30AM to 7:30AM adjacent the dam breast at Long Arm Dam in the parking lot 
provided the area is cleaned up after the service and returned to its previous condition 
following the event. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Reichart, seconded by Mr. Shea to award for the sale of Timber at 
the Sheppard Myers Impounding Dam Watershed as per bid specifications to Glatfelter, 
Spring Grove, PA, high bidder in the amount of $24,624.00. Motion carried. 

It was moved by Mr. Reichart, seconded by Mr. Shea to approve the Consumer Deposit 
Agreement with Cherrytree Properties of Spring Grove, LLC, 678 Old Hanover Road, 
Spring Grove, PA for the installation of approximately 950' of 8" water main on Grant 
Drive; including 14 - 1" single service laterals; and 20 - 1" double service laterals at a 
cost of $93,975.00. Motion carried. 

MAYOR'S REPORT 

Mayor Adams reported his attendance on February 5th at Hanover Hospital for the ribbon 
cutting ceremony and dedication for the new Cardiac Cath Lab where he read a 
proclamation for American Heart month. 

Mayor Adams thanked the Cub Scouts for their attendance this evening. 

OTHER MATTERS 

~ Communications 

Mr. Shea reported that there will be new construction on the lands adjacent where 
the fireworks are normally held for the July 4th Liberty Day Celebration at Moul 
Field, so the fireworks will not be able to be held at this location; there was 
discussion at the recent Public Service & Communications Committee meeting 
about the future of the event, noting there are no longer any open areas large 
enough to safely discharge the fireworks in the Borough. 

~ New Business 

Mr. Shea would like to schedule a Council tour of the current Fire Museum and the 
old Eagle Fire Company building with Councilman Roth. Same will be coordinated. 

~ Unfinished Business 

Mr. Shea thanked Manager Ford, Finance Director Miller and Secretary Neiderer 
for placing the Zoning Ordinance on the Borough's website. 



OTHER MATTERS 

>- Public Comment 

Mr. Scott Roland, 307 Primrose Lane questioned the Water Consumer Deposit 
Agreement policy, and the reason why money is paid back to the developers (for 
water line installation). President Noble stated Council is looking into revising the 
policy; and Manager Ford noted there will be more information on this policy and 
proposed changes in the future. 

Manager Ford stated we are in the process of acquiring RFP's for the Community 
Development Block Grant funding for rewriting the zoning ordinance in 
coordination with Penn Township. Manager Ford is also applying for additional 
funding for this purpose. 

Adjournment: 

President Noble asked all to stand while the Cub Scouts retire the colors; Finance Director 
Miller thanked Council for their cooperation with the Cub Scouts' attendance at this 
evening's meeting. 

It was moved by Mr. Reichart, seconded by Mr. Shea to adjourn the meeting at 7:20PM. 
Motion carried. 

Respectfully submitted, 

/J /k.Ji I 1141 
Dorothy Ne1derer 
Hanover Borough Secretary 



Pre-mixed Bituminous Material BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday1 Februarv 241 2016 at 6:00 PM 

Valley Quarries, Inc. * York Materials Group, LLC 

PO Box2009 950SmileWay 

Chambersburg, PA 17201 ,York, PA 17404 

Alternate #1 NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER· NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 
Approx. 

F.O.B. Plant Quantit~ Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 
,, ', ;_'', 

ID2 Surface Course (SRL Type M) 320 ton $54.30 $17,376.00 * . $53.55 $17;136;00 

ID2 Base Course 50 ton $45.10 $2,255.00 * 

Pre-Mixed Bituminous 

Stock Pile Material 335 ton $106.00 $35,510.00 * 

Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) 470 ton $42.70 $20,069.00 * 

ID3 Surface Course 200 ton $46.90 $9,380.00 * 

9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course 1,340 ton $54.30 $72,762.00 * 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

19 mm Superpave Surface Course 330 ton $46.90 $15,477.00 * 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

25 mm Superpave Base Course 600 ton $45.10 $27,060.00 * 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

Grand Total -Alternate #1 $199,889.00 *\ $19S.~2i.so 

Distance of Plant from Hanover Square is 14 miles * ,>3.1 ,mile~ miles miles 

Alternate #2 

F.O.B. Job (in 3 mile radius Approx. 

of Hanover Center Sguare} Quantitv Unit Price Total Price Unit Price· Totc:ll Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

ID2 (SRL-Type "M" Aggregate) 200 ton $59.921 $11,984.00 * $58:05•1"·.·· $11;61o.oo' 

Bituminous Concrete Base Course (BCBC) 200 ton $48.321 $9,664.00 * $49.50,. $9,900,00 

9.5 mm Superpave Surface Course 5,650 ton $59.92 I $338,548.00 * $5a.osl $327,982.50 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

19 mm Superpave Surface Course 1,300 ton $52.521 $68,276.00 * 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

25 mm Superpave Base Course 1,000 ton $50.721 $50,720.00 * $so.so I • $50,!i00.00 
(0.3 to 3.0 million ESAL mixes as specified) 

Grand Total- Alternate #2 $479,192.00 

Add charge per mile for each mile over $0.35 
3 mile radius from Hanover (One-way) Per ton mile Per ton mile Per ton mile Per ton mile 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 



Crushed Stone 

Purchase Product (PA DOT 
No. or AASHTO No.) 

Screenings (AASHTO 1 0) 

PA 2A & RC Stone 

Sand & Crushed Stone 

(PA anti-skid type 2) 

1 B Stone (AASHTO #8) & 
HE6 Stone (AASHTO #9) 

2B Stone (AASHTO #57) 

All other stone including: 

4" Ballast (AASHTO #1) 

(AASHT0#3) 

Rip-Rap (Including R-5 & R-4) 

Distance of bidder bin from Hanover Square 

C. Conewago Township 
D. McSherrystown Borough 
E. Union Township 
F. West Manheim Township 
G. Germany Township 

Approx 
Quantit)l 

455 ton 

5,750 ton 

2,650 ton 

850 ton 

1,270 ton 

1,250 ton 

500 ton 

BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00 PM 

Valley Quarries, Inc. 
PO Box 2009 
Chambersburg, PA 17201 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price 

$7.50 Net price per tor 

$6.25 Net price per tor 

$13.00 Net price per tor 

$13.00 Net price per tor 

$11.70 Net price per tor 

$11.70 Net price per tor 

* :Vulcan Construction Matenals LL Kinsley Materials 
875 Oxford Avenue ·. . . · PO Box 2886 
H_an_.over,.P __ A-17331 .>' ·· York, PA 17405 . . .. , ~ 

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price 

* • ~ -c- ~ Net price pel" ton $9.75 Net price per ton 

* $6.00 Net price per ton 

* ··• N~tprice~~f;:1~~ 
,...........-:.;....;..;..'--...;. 

.>: :~: .:~.::'.:~~y> 
$10.50 Net price per ton 

* N~t--p~ice.-~~/t6h ;....;..;.._,........,...........;. $10.75 Net price perton 

* , __ . _ _ Netpric~ p~r t~n $9.75 Net price per ton 

* Net price pE)rtqn 
_...;....,;-.:._.:..-..;._ 

$9.75 Net price per ton 

$15.40 Net price per tor * $14.50 NE)tpricepei"t()~ $17.00 Net price per ton 

14 miles 

$4.79 Perton 
$4.79 Per ton 
$4.66 Per ton 
$6.71 Per ton 
~Per ton 

* 
* 
* 
* 

* 

. $1.70 Perton 
$1.70 Per ton 
---~Perton 

$2:60 Per ton 
~Per tori 

17 miles 

$5.90 Per ton 

$5.90 Per ton 

$5.90 Per ton 
$5.90 Per ton 
$6.75 Per ton 
$6.75 Per ton 
~Per ton 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

York Building Products 
9950 Smile Way 
York, PA 17404 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price 

$10.25 Net price per ton 

$8.10 Net price per ton 

$10.80 Net price per ton 

$11.35 Net price per ton 

$10.25 Net price perton 

$10.25 Net price perton 

$13.85 Net price per ton 

12 miles ----

$4.10 Per ton 

$4.10 Per ton 

$4.45 Per ton 
$4.65 Per ton 
$5.00 Per ton 
$4.10 Per ton 
$5:70 Per ton 



Petroleum Products 

Gasoline 

1A. Regular Lead-Free Minimum 87 Octane 

1 B. Premium or Super Lead-Free minimum 92 Octane 

Motor Oil 

2A. #5-20 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade/55 gal. drums 

2B. #15-40 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade in bulk 

2C. #15-40 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade in 55 gal drums 

2D. #10-20 Hydraulic Oil/low foaming action, in bulk 

2E. #10-20 Hydraulic Oil/low foaming action, in 55 gal drums 

Chassis Lubricant 
3. Multi-purpose Grease (meets new car warranty) 

in 120 lb. No-return drums 

Diesel Oil 
4. Diesel #2 Straight Run 

Fuel Oil 
5. Fuel Oil #2 

Kerosene 
6. Standard Kerosene 

Dexron II Transmission Fluid 
7. Transmission Fluid-Dexron II, in 55 gal. drums 

Synthetic Gear Oil 
8A. Mobil SCH 634 Synthetic Lubricant, or equal, 

in 55 gal. drums 

Distance of Bidders Location from Hanover Center Square: 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00 PM 

* Mid~Atlantic. Cooperative Solutions . 

Approx 
Quantity 

103,000 gal. 

1,100 gal. 

165 gal. 

1,200 gal. 

330 gal. 

650 gal. 

220 gal. 

360 lbs. 

94,500 gal. 

13,500 gal. 

110 gal. 

110 gal. 

55 gal. 

dba Aero Energy * . PPC Lubricants, Inc. 
230 Lincolnway East. 305 Micro Dfive .. · ... ·. 
New Oxford, PA ti350 Jonestown,.E>A 17038 ·· 
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIIJR_ER NAME OF BIDDER 

Trade Name Price/Gal. Trade Name Price/Gal. Trade Name 

* u/b $1.302 no bid 

"' · .. u/b $1,754. no bid 

no bid * 

no bid * 

no bid 

no bid 

no bid 

no bid 

* u/b $1.3263 no bid 

* u/b $1.3439 no bid 

no bid no bid 

no bid * 

no bid 

6.75 miles 68 miles 

NAME OF BIDDER 

Price/Gal. Trade Name Price/Gal. 

/lb. /lb. 

miles miles 



BID TABULATION SHEET 

Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00PM 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt 

Alternate #1 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk 
quantities to be delivered in 
minimum quantities of forty 
thousand (40,000) pound dump 
truck loads. FOB Bidder's Plant 

Delivered before 7/1/16 
OR 

Delivered before 10/1/16 
OR 

Delivered after 1 0/1/16 

Quantity 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square 

Bins are located at: 

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is 
(One-way travel time) 

Alternate #2 

Standard Calcium Chloride in 

50 to 1 00 lb. bags or drums. 

FOB Destination 

Quantity 

1 ton 

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal. 

*Harvey Salt Co,, Inc. 
1325 Mohrs Lane. 
Baltimore, MD 21220 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price 

$80.24 I $258,533.28 

$80.24 I $258,533.28 

$82.24 I $264,977.28 

58 miles __ ___:__ 

Baltimore, MD 

74 minutes -----

Unit Price Total Price 

* $659.20 $659.20 

no bid no bid 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

Calcium Chloride Sales, Inc. Oceanport LLC 
713 West Main Street 134 Middle St- Suite 210 
Grove City, PA 16127 Lowell, MA 01852 
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid $75.90 1 $244,549.80 

no bid no bid $77.90 1 $250,993.80 

no bid no bid $79.90 1 $257,437.80 

miles 115 miles ----

Claymont, DE 

minutes 1.5 hours -----

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid no bid no bid 

$1.7o I $6,aoo.oo no bid no bid 

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology 
24950 Country Club Blvd * American Rock Salt Co LLC 
Suite #450 POBox 190 
North Olmsted, OH 44070 Mt. Morris, NY 14510 
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price 

$77.231 $248,835.06 

$77.231 $248,835.06 

$79.231 $255,279.06 

45 miles 

Baltimore, MD 

60 minutes 

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

* 

Unit Price Total Price 

·$-ro.io I $227,795AO · 

$'70:701 .. $227,795.40 

$232,145 .. 10 

30 minutes -----

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 



BID TABULATION SHEET 
BIDS TO BE OPENED WEDNESDAY, February 3, 2016 at 5:00 PM 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt 

Alternate #1 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk 
quantities to be delivered in 
minimum quantities of forty 
thousand (40,000) pound dump 
truck loads. FOB Bidder's Plant 

Delivered before 7/1/15 
OR 

Delivered before 10/1/15 
OR 

Delivered after 10/1/15 

Quantity 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square 

Bins are located at: 

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is 
(One-way travel time) 

Alternate #2 

Standard Calcium Chloride in 
50 to 1 00 lb. bags or drums. 
FOB Destination 

Quantity 

1 ton 

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal. 

* E~;~virotech Services, l.nc. 
910 54th Avenue #230 
Greeley; CO 80634 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

miles -----

minutes -----

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

* $1.12 $4,480.00 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

Central Salt 
385 Airport Rd - Suite 1 08 
Elgin, IL 60123 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Recon Construction Services, Inc. 

3289 Susquehanna Trail N 
York, PA 17406 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid no bid no bid 

no bid no bid no bid no bid 

no bid no bid no bid no bid 

miles ----- _____ miles 

minutes minutes ----- -----

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid no bid no bid 

no bid no bid $1.14 $4,560.00 

Morton Salt, Inc. 
123 N. Wacker Drive 
Chicago, IL 60606-1743 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price 

$98.531 $317,463.66 

$98.531 $317,463.66 

$98.531 $317,463.66 

52.78 miles 

Baltimore, MD 

1 hour 7 minutes 

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

Compass Minerals 
9900 W. 1 09th St-Suite 100 
Overland, Park, KS 66210 
NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

miles -----

minutes -----

Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 



Snow & Ice Rock Salt 

Alternate #1 

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk 
quantities to be delivered in 
minimum quantities of forty 
thousand (40,000) pound dump 
truck loads. FOB Bidder's Plant 

Delivered before 7/1/15 
OR 

Delivered before 10/1/15 
OR 

Delivered after 10/1/15 

Quantity 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 

3,222 ton 
Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square 

Bins are located at: 

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is 
(One-way travel time) 

Alternate #2 

Standard Calcium Chloride in 
50 to 1 00 lb. bags or drums. 
FOB Destination 

Quantity 

1 ton 

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal. 

BID TABULATION SHEET 
BIDS TO BE OPENED WEDNESDAY, February 3, 2016 at 5:00PM 
Chemung Supply Corp. 
PO Box 527 
Elmira, NY 14902 
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

no bid no bid 

no bid no bid 

no bid I no bid 
miles ----- miles ----- _____ miles 

minutes ----- _____ minutes minutes -----

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

$675.00 $675.00 

no bid no bid 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016 @ 6:00 PM 

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

miles miles ----- -----

minutes minutes ----- -----

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 



Chemical Bids BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00PM 

* Evoqua Water Gulbrandsen Technologies Inc. * USALCO 
*Main Pool & Chemical Co Inc. *UNIVAR USA, Inc, Technologies LLC 2 Main St -Baltimore-Plant l.LC 

11 0 Commerce Road 532 East Emaus Street 2650 Tallevast.Road PO Box 5523 2601 CanneryAve 
Dupont, PA 18641 Middletown,PA 17057. Sarasota, FL · 34243 Clinton, NJ 08809 'Baltimore, MD 21229 

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine per lb. * $0.79 per lb. per lb. per lb. per lb. 

B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine per lb. * $0.40 per lb. 
-----············--

per lb. per lb. per lb. 

C. HTH tablets in 100 lb. drums * $329.00 percwt $338.25 percwt percwt percwt percwt 

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads per gal. 
-------·····-

per gal. * $0;669. per gal. per gal. per gal. 

E. Copper Sulphate in 50 lb. bags * $23§.00 __ per cwt $245.60 
--------

percwt percwt percwt . per cwt 

F. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk $3. 75/gallon percwt * $3.22/gal or $31. 71· per cwt percwt percwt per cwt 
' 

G. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads per gal. 
---· 

per gal. per gal. $0.885 per gal. * $Q]614 per gal. 

H. Sulphur Dioxide in one (1) ton containers per ton * $1,380.00 
-------

per ton per ton per ton per ton 

I. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk per gal. per gal. per gal. $1.21 per gal. * $1.065 per gal. 

J. Sodium Permanganate in 550 lb. drums * 0.975 per lb. $1.45 
·---

per lb. per lb. per lb. per lb. 

K. Caustic Soda in bulk $1.84 per gal. * $1.64 per gal. per gal. per gal. per gal. 

Total Alternate #1 Bid for Items A through K 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 



Chemical Bids BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesdal£1 Februa!Y 241 2016 at 6:00 PM 
Kemira Water George S. Coyne Thatcher Company of Chemtrade Chemicals Kuehne Chemical 
Solutions, Inc. Chemical Co., Inc. New York, Inc. US LLC Company, Inc. 
4321 W 6th St 3015 State Road PO Box 27407 90 East Halsey Road 86 N. Hackensack Ave 
Lawrence KS 66049 Cro~don, PA 19021-6997 Salt Lake Cit~. UT 84127 Parssiean~. NJ 07054 South Kearn~. NJ 07032 

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 
(min. 5 cylinders/delivery) 

A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine . per lb. $1.0079 per lb. per lb. per lb. per lb . 

B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine per lb. per lb. per lb. per lb. $0.50 per lb. 

(min. 2 drums/delivery-quantity needed is only 1 drum) 

C. HTH tablets in 100 lb. drums percwt $288.18 percwt percwt percwt percwt 

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads per gal. _per gal. 
·~--· 

per gal. per gal. per gal. 

E. Copper Sulphate in 50 lb. bags percwt percwt per cwt percwt percwt 
(min. 2,500 gallons/delivery) 

F. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk per cwt __ 3.953/gaHon percwt percwt percwt percwt 

G. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads 
... 

per gal. per gal. $0.859 per gal. $1.0719 per gal. per gal. 

H. Sulphur Dioxide in one (1) ton containers per ton per ton per ton per ton per ton 

(Kemira PAX XL6) 

I. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk $1.13 per gal. per gal. per gal. $2.568 per gal. per gal. 
(min. 4 drums/delivery-quantity needed is only 1700 g) 

J. Sodium Permanganate in 550 lb. drums per lb. $1.0655 per lb. per lb. per lb. per lb. 

K. Caustic Soda in bulk per gal. per gal. per gal. per gal. $2.3962 per gal. 

Total Alternate #1 Bid for Items A through K 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 



Chemical Bids BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesda)l1 Februa!:Y 241 2016 at 6:00 PM 
Calcium Chloride SNF Polydyne 
Sales, Inc. Holland Company, Inc. 1 Chemical Plant Rd 
713 W Main St 153 Howland Avenue PO box 279 
Grove Cit~, PA 16127 Adams, MA 01220 Riceboro, GA 31323 

Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. per lb. per lb. 

B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. per lb. per lb. 

C. HTH tablets in 100 lb. drums No Bid per cwt No Bid percwt No Bid per cwt percwt percwt 

D. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. per gal. per gal. 

E. Copper Sulphate in 50 lb. bags No Bid percwt No Bid percwt No Bid per cwt percwt percwt 

F. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk No Bid percwt No Bid percwt No Bid per cwt percwt percwt 

G. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. per gal. per gal. 

H. Sulphur Dioxide in one (1) ton containers No Bid per ton No Bid 
-------······---····-··-

per ton __ No Bid~-- per ton per ton per ton 

I. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in bulk No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. per gal. per gal. 

J. Sodium Permanganate in 550 lb. drums No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. No Bid per lb. per lb. per lb. 

K. Caustic Soda in bulk No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. No Bid per gal. per gal. per gal. 

Total Alternate #1 Bid for Items A through K No Bid No Bid No Bid 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 



Traffic Line Painting 

Center Line Painting 

Two -four (4") inch yellow lines 

Total Price for 95 Miles: 

Lane & Edge Line Painting 

One- four (4") inch white line 
(solid or dashed) 
Total Price for 96 Miles: 

Total Price 

BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00 PM 

DE Gemmill, Inc. Midlantic Marking, Inc. 
* Alpha Sp~ce 

C<:>ntro!"Co:, Inc.. DeAngelo Brothers, LLC 
10174 Chapel Church Rd PO Box 7997 158() Gaibl~rRd . . 100 North Conahan Drive 
Red Lion, PA 17356 Gaithersburg, MD 20898 Chambersburg, PA 17201. Hazleton, PA 18201 
NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OFI31DDER . NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 

$0.098 per LF $0.106 perLF T-·.,--·- $0.117 per LF per LF 

$49,156.80 $53,169.60 * $58,687.20 

$0.048 per LF $0.055 per LF ..... -.-,.. .. _ $0.0585 per LF per LF 

$24,330.24 $27,878.40 * $29,652.48 

$73,487.04 $81,048.00 * $73,133:28 $88,339.68 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

NAME OF BIDDER 

----~--per LF 

______ per LF 



BID TABULATION SHEET 
Bids awarded Wednesday, February 24, 2016 at 6:00 PM 

WATER BORNE TRAFFIC PAINT PRODUCTS 

Water Borne Pavement Markings Approximate 
As per Bid Specifications: Quantities 

A. White (5 gallon pails) 615 gallons 

B. Yellow (5 gallon pails) 220 gallons 

* Mike Cummings Company, Inc. 
3 EastKing Street 

Littlestown,PA 17340 
NAMEOFBJDDER . 

Trade Name< 

$13;46 per gaL 
~ ·-,>x~~J~:-

,,,',':'·/',·.::"' 

$13:78 per gal. 
; ,' 

Sherwin Williams Paint Co. 

1010 Eichelberger Street 
·. Hanover, PA 17331 

NAME OF BIDDER 

Trade Name Unit Price 

Sherwin Williams $13.99 per gal. 

Sherwin Williams $14.99 per gal. 

C. Blue (5 gallon pails) 30 gallons PPG $13:38 per g~L • Sherwin Williams $13.99 per gal. 

NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER 
Water Borne Pavement Markings Approximate 
As per Bid Specifications: Quantities Trade Name Unit Price Trade Name Unit Price 

A. White (5 gallon pails) 615 gallons _____ per gal. _____ per gal. 

B. Yellow (5 gallon pails) 220 gallons _____ per gal. -----per gal. 

per gal. ----- per gal. -----30 gallons C. Blue (5 gallon pails) 

*Indicates successful bidder awarded February 24th, 2016@ 6:00PM 

NAME OF BIDDER 

Trade Name Unit Price 

_____ per gal. 

_____ per gal. 

_____ per gal. 

NAME OF BIDDER 

Trade Name Unit Price 

_____ per gal. 

per gal. -----

_____ per gal. 


